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Marisol Camacho <marisol.camacho@biolacsd.org>

oy .
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Re: Levee Repair At the WWTF

Cruz Ramos <cruz.ramos@biolacsd.org> Wed, Feb 8, 2023 at 5:08 PM
To: Randy Johnson <rjohnson@mvenvironmental.com>, Tammy Cunningham <tcunningham@mvenvironmental.com>,
James Bell <jbell@mvenvironmental.com>

Cc: "Jennifer M. Duarte" <jennifer.duarte@biolacsd.org>, Marisol Camacho <marisol.camacho@biolacsd.org>, Pete Cerna
<pete.cerna@biolacsd.org>

Randy, please this is what | remember: " approval was given by me to fix the one that needed immediate repairs &
costs." Thank you for 'time and materials" basis...can we have an estimate of cost? The other two projects were to be
listed in priority order along with their respective costs as BCSD doesn't have funds for infrastructure
repairs/replacements. Staff was going to use Tammy's spreadsheet, can that one be updated to speed things up?

All of this is necessary as it will be on the February 16, meeting agenda for Board approval and it's been long in

waiting...thank you for your patience. Your area is not the only one that lacked prior attention and now falls on current
staff.

Again, thanks,
Cruz

On Wed, Feb 8, 2023 at 3:37 PM Randy Johnson <rjchnson@mvenvironmental.com> wrote:
Hi Cruz,

As per our discussion earlier this morning, I am confirming the verbal approval for the temporary repair of
 the levee damage caused by the squirrels and storms. We had a quote from a contractor early last year to do
the work for about $44,000 for just the one levee. There are now three levees that are damaged. We plan
- on removing the damaged levees down to the pond bottom elevation and angling back the banks to help
- prevent further damage and costlier future repairs. We will do this work on a time and material basis and

expect to be able to get it done in under 2 weeks, weather dependent.

Randy D. Yolnson

President,

MOUNTAIN VALLEY Mountain Valley Environmental Services, Inc.
Office: 209-742-2626
Mobile: 209-484-5003
Email: rjohnson@mvenvironmental.com

1050 Ben Hur Rd.

Raymond Ca, 95653
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Mountain Valley Environmental Services, Inc. InVOice
é 1050 Ben Hur Rd. Date Invoice #
G Raymond, CA 93653 2/9/2023 4136
mountamvatey - (209)742-2626

: . ; - 4925 N Seventh St.
Biola Community Services District Biola, C Ae 33206
PO Box 57

Biola, CA 93606

P.O. No. Terms Due Date
NET 21 3/2/2023
Description Quantity Rate Serviced Amount
Service Repair on 2/8/2023 at following (3) locations: 1 7,673.03 2/8/2023 7,673.03
12419 F St. Biola
4814 Seventh St., Biola
12452 G St., Biola
Notified by Pete Cerna that the water service lines were leaking before the water
meters. Excavated the area around the meters, removed the meter boxes, exposed
the leaking service lines, repaired the lines with brass repair unions, restored the
water, checked for leakage, backfilled the hole with District sand and reset the
meter box. Had to replace the angle meter valve at one location.
Thank you for your business. TOtaI $7,673.03

Accounts past due may be charged 1.5% service fee permonth until paid in full. Minimum finance charge $5.00.

Phone # E-mail

(209) 742-2626 accounting@mvenvironmental.com
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Mountain Valley Environmental Services, Inc. I nvo i ce
é 1050 Ben Hur Rd. o TR
. SR, LA e 2/9/2023 4135
mountamyvartey  (209)742-2626

Bill To Ship To

: 3 : . 4925 N Seventh St.
Biola Community Services District Biola, CA 93606
PO Box 57

Biola, CA 93606

P.O. No. Terms Due Date
NET 21 3/2/2023
Description Quantity Rate Serviced Amount
Service Repair on 2/6/2023 at following (2) locations: 1, 7,103.63 2/6/2021 7,103.63
4660 Fourth St, Biola
12465 G St, Biola
Notified by Pete Cerna that the water service lines were leaking before the water
meters. Excavated the area around the meters, removed the meter boxes, exposed
the leaking service lines, repaired the lines with brass repair unions, restored the
water, checked for leakage, backfilled the hole with District sand and reset the
meter box.
Thank you for your business. Total $7,103.63

Accounts past due may be charged 1.5% service fee permonth until paid in full. Minimum finance charge $5.00.

Phone # E-mail

(209) 742-2626 accounting@mvenvironmental.com




